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The Center for Veterinary Dentistry and Oral 
Surgery in Gaithersburg, MD is pleased to announce that 
Dr. Kendall Taney has achieved the most advanced 
certification in oral and maxillofacial surgery recognized 
by the American Veterinary Dental College. The AVDC 
recently developed a fellowship program to recognize 
and promote highly skilled specialists with expertise in 
the most complex oral and maxillofacial surgery tech-
niques. There are currently less than twenty AVDC Oral 
and Maxillofacial Surgery Fellows worldwide.  

The Center for 

Veterinary Dentistry 

and Oral Surgery 

offers treatment for 

a variety of complex 

disorders such as 

large head and 

neck tumors, repair 

of cleft lip and

palate defects, jaw fractures, and certain ear, 

nose, and throat procedures. The Center utilizes 

cutting edge equipment and techniques 

such as cone beam computed tomography 

(CBCT) imaging, piezoelectric surgery, 

bone plating, and minimally invasive fracture 

repair technology. The Center welcomes 

consultations on complex cases.

Dr. Taney completed a rigorous two-year fellowship 
program and passed its board examination in May 
2022 to become an AVDC Fellow, Oral and 
Maxillofacial Surgery. She has been a partner at the 
Center for Veterinary Dentistry and Oral Surgery since 
2008 and became a Diplomate of the American 
Veterinary Dental College in 2008 as well. Much of her 
career has been dedicated to the treatment of com-
plex maxillofacial disorders including trauma, oral 
oncologic surgery, and reconstructive surgery.  She 
has authored numerous publications on advanced 
oral surgery, including a recent study on reconstruc-
tion of hard palate defects. 
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https://www.frontiersin.org/articles/10.3389/fvets.2021.762842/full

